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A twist of fate ripped them apart. Can a second kiss make them whole again?

For over five years, Lucy Rivers has been estranged from her family. Heartbroken after her mother’s death,
she was unable to forgive her father’s betrayal for remarrying so soon after the tragic event that shook up
their lives. And not only that, the marriage put a stop to her budding relationship with her high school
sweetheart, Cole Kent, as he was now her new stepbrother. Lucy sought a new life, leaving her family
behind.

However, unwilling to let her go, Cole hunts high and low for years to find Lucy again. And just when
Cole’s about to give up, by chance her face pops up on a dating app he’d reluctantly signed up to.

Can Cole get Lucy to trust him again? Will Lucy be able to forgive her dad before it's too late?

Your next 5-star read, Kiss Me Again, is a sweet & steamy novella that will make you fall in love again
and again.
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From reader reviews:

Denice Cooke:

The book Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother Romance (Second Chances) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for
your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best
friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading a book
Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother Romance (Second Chances) for being your habit, you can get considerably
more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like start and read a guide Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother Romance (Second Chances).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Richard Holeman:

The book with title Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother Romance (Second Chances) has lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

John Harrison:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother
Romance (Second Chances), you may enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to
miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh
come on its known as reading friends.

Carmela Martin:

The book untitled Kiss Me Again: a Stepbrother Romance (Second Chances) contain a lot of information on
the idea. The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people,
so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author
will bring you in the new period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read on
your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish
to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice read.
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