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Nearly half of all countries emerging from conflict relapse into war within a few years of signing a peace
agreement. The post-war trajectories of armed groups vary from demilitarization to remilitarisation.  In
Organized Violence after Civil War, Daly analyzes evidence from 37 militia groups in Colombia,
demonstrating that the primary driving force behind these changes is the variation in recruitment patterns
within, and between, the warring groups after peace accords. She documents the transition from war to peace
in interviews with militia commanders, combatants and victims. Using rich ex-combatant survey data and
geo-coded information on violence over forty years of war, Daly explains the dynamics inside armed
organizations and the strategic interactions between them. She also shows how these theories can be used
beyond Colombia, both within the region of Latin America and in the rest of the world.
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From reader reviews:

Kirsten Muncy:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but
the problems coming to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Organized
Violence after Civil War: The Geography of Recruitment in Latin America (Cambridge Studies in
Comparative Politics) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Ruth Williams:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Organized
Violence after Civil War: The Geography of Recruitment in Latin America (Cambridge Studies in
Comparative Politics) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Jennifer Nava:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of
book Organized Violence after Civil War: The Geography of Recruitment in Latin America (Cambridge
Studies in Comparative Politics). You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it
might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.

John Tammaro:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book.
A substantial number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra
Organized Violence after Civil War: The Geography of Recruitment in Latin America (Cambridge Studies in
Comparative Politics).
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