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From Book 1: For eleven years, Oakley Farrell has been silent. At the age of five, she stopped talking, and
no one seems to know why. Refusing to communicate beyond a few physical actions, Oakley remains in her
own little world.

Bullied at school, she has just one friend, Cole Benson. Cole stands by her, refusing to believe that she is not
perfect the way she is. Over the years, they have developed their own version of a normal friendship.
However, will it still work as they start to grow even closer?

When Oakley is forced to face someone from her past, can she hold her secret in any longer?

*Silence deals with sensitive issues*
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From reader reviews:

Anna Gann:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Silence (4 Book Series). You can choose the best book if
you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important the book Silence (4 Book Series). You
can add know-how and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact
from book you can know everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself
known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to open a
book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's read.

Brandon Justice:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Silence (4 Book Series)
that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading behavior all over
the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you
who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you
are able to pick Silence (4 Book Series) become your own personal starter.

Justin Campbell:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Silence (4 Book Series) is
simple to deliver you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have
got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it.
You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy
this book.

Lamar Santiago:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. Through the book Silence (4 Book Series) we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be
creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book. Merely choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book Silence (4 Book Series).
You can more attractive than now.
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