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Weekends on the road: The best of the American and Canadian West Coast
 
The New York Times has been offering up dream weekends with practical itineraries in its popular weekly
“36 Hours” column since 2002. The many expert contributors have brought careful research, insider’s
knowledge, and a sense of fun to hundreds of cities and destinations, always with an eye to getting the most
out of a short trip. Based on the best-selling book 36 Hours: 150 Weekends in the USA & Canada, the
Times and TASCHEN now bring together the best of the West Coast. From the great urban centers on
everyone’s travel list to surprising locales with undiscovered character and charm, the paths lead to the
seaside cliffs and Hollywood cool of California, biking in Portland, island hopping in Hawaii, and well
beyond.

Featured destinations:
Berkeley, California • Big Sur, Calif. • Carmel, Calif. • Death Valley, Calif. • Hilo, Hawaii • Homer, Alaska
• Honolulu, Hawaii • Juneau, Alaska • Kauai, Hawaii • Lake Tahoe, Calif. • Los Angeles, Calif. • Malibu,
Calif. • Mammoth Lakes, Calif. • Maui, Hawaii • Molokai, Hawaii • Napa Valley, Calif. • Palm Springs,
Calif. • Pasadena, Calif. • Portland, Oregon • Sacramento, Calif. • San Diego, Calif. • San Francisco, Calif.
• Santa Barbara, Calif. • Santa Cruz, Calif. • Santa Monica, Calif. • Seattle, Washington • Silicon Valley,
Calif. • Sonoma County, Calif. • The Okanagan Valley, British Columbia • The Oregon Coast, Oregon • The
San Juan Islands, Washington • Vancouver, British Columbia • Whistler, British Columbia • Whitehorse,
Yukon.

Also available in this series:
Northeast • Southeast • Midwest & Great Lakes • Southwest & Rocky Mountains
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From reader reviews:

James Brier:

The book The New York Times: 36 Hours USA & Canada, West Coast gives you the sense of being enjoy
for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your
best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make
reading a book The New York Times: 36 Hours USA & Canada, West Coast being your habit, you can get
much more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like available and read a reserve The New York Times: 36 Hours USA &
Canada, West Coast. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So ,
how do you think about this e-book?

Evelina Lewis:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular The New York Times: 36 Hours USA
& Canada, West Coast book as beginner and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

David Wysocki:

This The New York Times: 36 Hours USA & Canada, West Coast tend to be reliable for you who want to be
described as a successful person, why. The main reason of this The New York Times: 36 Hours USA &
Canada, West Coast can be one of several great books you must have is usually giving you more than just
simple examining food but feed an individual with information that possibly will shock your previous
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-
book and printed types. Beside that this The New York Times: 36 Hours USA & Canada, West Coast forcing
you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking
that we understand it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Delores Villarreal:

The New York Times: 36 Hours USA & Canada, West Coast can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article
author giving his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing The New York Times: 36
Hours USA & Canada, West Coast nevertheless doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest
in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn



you into brand-new stage of crucial contemplating.
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