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'You will most certainly find answers to some of your toughest design problems between the covers of this
volume' Steven H Leibson, Editor in Chief, EDN Magazine. Since its first appearance in 1956, EDN has
established itself as the clear leader in the provision of electronics information, with a combined circulation
in the USA, Europe and Asia of over 150,000 copies every fortnight. This is an annotated, indexed and cross
referenced collection of work from the magazine for electronic designers.

A collected volume of the best articles from the extensive files of Ian Hickman was published in 1991. The
articles provide a wealth of information on components, equipment, circuits, systems and standards that
prove to be extremely popular and useful for practising electronics engineers. This second volume of
collected articles includes subjects not covered in the first, and more recent items, to provide a completely
up-to-date compilation, covering subjects including analog and digital circuits, test and measurement,
software and algorithms. The articles are cross-referenced and indexed for ease of use. Many of the circuits
are from the popular 'design ideas' section where readers submit their own designs. Longer review articles
written by the magazine staff are also included.
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From reader reviews:

James Davis:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important usually. The book EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for Design
Engineers) seemed to be making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is very advantages for you. The publication EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for
Design Engineers) is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to get your friend when you
feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book
EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for Design Engineers). You never experience lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Antione Wilson:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for
Design Engineers) as your daily resource information.

Fernando Gallimore:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of
numerous ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks.
When you read this EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for Design Engineers), you could tells your
family, friends and soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a
publication.

Kerstin Torres:

Exactly why? Because this EDN Designers Companion (EDN Series for Design Engineers) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you with the secret
that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such incredible way
makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely.
So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will
give you a lot of advantages than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your



critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the
book store hurriedly.
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