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From the author of Jerusalem Maiden comes a mesmerizing, thought-provoking novel that tells the riveting
story of an American woman—the daughter of Holocaust survivors—who travels to Russia shortly after the
fall of communism, and finds herself embroiled in a perilous mafia conspiracy that could irrevocably destroy
her life.

Brooke Fielding, a thirty-eight year old New York investment manager and daughter of Jewish Holocaust
survivors, finds her life suddenly upended in late September 1993 when her job is unexpectedly put in
jeopardy. Brooke accepts an invitation to join a friend on a mission to Moscow to teach entrepreneurial skills
to Russian business women, which will also give her a chance to gain expertise in the new, vast emerging
Russian market. Though excited by the opportunity to save her job and be one of the first Americans to visit
Russia after the fall of communism, she also wonders what awaits her in the country that persecuted her
mother just a generation ago.

Inspired by the women she meets, Brooke becomes committed to helping them investigate the crime that
threatens their businesses. But as the uprising of the Russian parliament against President Boris Yeltsin turns
Moscow into a volatile war zone, Brooke will find that her involvement comes at a high cost. For in a city
where “capitalism” is still a dirty word, where neighbors spy on neighbors and the new economy is in the
hands of a few dangerous men, nothing Brooke does goes unnoticed—and a mistake in her past may now
compromise her future.

A moving, poignant, and rich novel, Hotel Moscow is an eye-opening portrait of post-communist Russia and
a profound exploration of faith, family, and heritage.
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From reader reviews:

Tina Brookins:

With other case, little persons like to read book Hotel Moscow: A Novel. You can choose the best book if
you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a new book Hotel Moscow: A Novel.
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the
fact from book you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple point until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book
or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Eva Byrd:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for all of us. The book Hotel Moscow: A Novel had been making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for
you. The guide Hotel Moscow: A Novel is not only giving you much more new information but also to get
your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make
relationship using the book Hotel Moscow: A Novel. You never experience lose out for everything in case
you read some books.

David Guyton:

This Hotel Moscow: A Novel book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is information inside this book incredible fresh, you will
get info which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That Hotel Moscow: A Novel
without we comprehend teach the one who examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't
end up being worry Hotel Moscow: A Novel can bring whenever you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This Hotel
Moscow: A Novel having great arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not sense uninterested
in reading.

Colleen Key:

Beside this specific Hotel Moscow: A Novel in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get nearer to
the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from the
oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Hotel Moscow: A Novel because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you
occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you
have this within your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring
beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and also read it from right now!
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