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Created by the bestselling SF novelist Jerry Pournelle, THERE WILL BE WAR is a landmark science fiction
anthology series that combines top-notch military science fiction with factual essays by various generals and
military experts on everything from High Frontier and the Strategic Defense Initiative to the aftermath of the
Vietnam War. It features some of the greatest military science fiction ever published, such Orson Scott
Card’s “Ender’s Game” in Volume I and Joel Rosenberg’s “Cincinnatus” in Volume II. Many science fiction
greats were featured in the original nine-volume series, which ran from 1982 to 1990, including Robert
Heinlein, Arthur C. Clarke, Philip K. Dick, Gordon Dickson, Poul Anderson, John Brunner, Gregory
Benford, Robert Silverberg, Harry Turtledove, and Ben Bova.

33 years later, Castalia House has teamed up with Dr. Pournelle to make this classic science fiction series
available to the public again. THERE WILL BE WAR is a treasure trove of science fiction and history that
will educate and amaze new readers while reminding old ones how much the world has changed over the last
three decades. Most of the stories, like war itself, remain entirely relevant today.

THERE WILL BE WAR Volume I is edited by Jerry Pournelle and John F. Carr, and features 23 stories,
articles, and poems. Of particular note are “Reflex” by Larry Niven and Jerry Pournelle, the original
“Ender’s Game” novella by Orson Scott Card, “The Defenders” by Philip K. Dick, and a highly influential
pair of essays devoted to the then-revolutionary concept of “High Frontier” by Robert A. Heinlein and Lt.
General Daniel Graham.
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From reader reviews:

John Lyons:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book There Will Be War Volume I will
make you to become smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of
you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they may
be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or acceptable book with you?

Stephen Ziegler:

This book untitled There Will Be War Volume I to be one of several books this best seller in this year, that's
because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no
reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Bruce Zimmerman:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
forms of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also soon.
The There Will Be War Volume I provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Donald Andrews:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This There Will Be War Volume I is
simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not
include much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it.
You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when you buy this book.
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