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Despite the many advances that the United States has made in racial equality over the past half century,
numerous events within the past several years have proven prejudice to be alive and well in modern-day
America. In one such example, Governor Nikki Haley of South Carolina dismissed one of her principal
advisors in 2013 when his membership in the ultra-conservative Council of Conservative Citizens (CCC)
came to light. According to the Southern Poverty Law Center, in 2001 the CCC website included a message
that read "God is the one who divided mankind into different races.... Mixing the races is rebelliousness
against God." This episode reveals America's continuing struggle with race, racial integration, and race
mixing-a problem that has plagued the United States since its earliest days as a nation.

The Color Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South
demonstrates that the emergent twenty-first-century recognition of race mixing and the relative advantages of
light-skinned, mixed-race people represent a re-emergence of one salient feature of race in America that
dates to its founding. Economist Howard Bodenhorn presents the first full-length study of the ways in which
skin color intersected with policy, society, and economy in the nineteenth-century South. With empirical and
statistical rigor, the investigation confirms that individuals of mixed race experienced advantages over
African Americans in multiple dimensions - in occupations, family formation and family size, wealth, health,
and access to freedom, among other criteria.

The Color Factor concludes that we will not really understand race until we understand how American
attitudes toward race were shaped by race mixing. The text is an ideal resource for students, social scientists,
and historians, and anyone hoping to gain a deeper understanding of the historical roots of modern race
dynamics in America.
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From reader reviews:

Jeraldine Thurman:

This The Color Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South
(National Bureau of Economic Research) are generally reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this The Color Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being
in the Nineteenth-Century South (National Bureau of Economic Research) can be one of many great books
you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you with information that
probably will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and
whenever your conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Color Factor: The Economics of
African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South (National Bureau of Economic Research)
giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that
we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Amber Weitz:

This The Color Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South
(National Bureau of Economic Research) is great publication for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who also always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having The Color
Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South (National Bureau
of Economic Research) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one
particular. We can say that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen minute right but this publication
already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in
which?

Pearl McLean:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This The Color Factor: The Economics
of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South (National Bureau of Economic Research)
is simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did
not have got much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler
to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when one buys this book.

Brenda Evans:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book The Color Factor: The Economics of



African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South (National Bureau of Economic Research) to
make your personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading proficiency is developing when you just like
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and
studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the reserve
The Color Factor: The Economics of African-American Well-Being in the Nineteenth-Century South
(National Bureau of Economic Research) can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and
confuse with the information must you're doing of the time.
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