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To Secure These Rights enters the fascinating--and often contentious--debate over constitutional
interpretation. Scott Douglas Gerber here argues that the Constitution of the United States should be
interpreted in light of the natural rights political philosophy of the Declaration of Independence and that the
Supreme Court is the institution of American government that should be primarily responsible for identifying
and applying that philosophy in American life.

Importantly, the theory advanced in this book--what Gerber calls liberal originalism--is neither consistently
liberal nor consistently conservative in the modern conception of those terms. Rather, the theory is liberal in
the classic sense of viewing the basic purpose of government to be safeguarding the natural rights of
individuals. As Thomas Jefferson wrote in the Declaration of Independence, to secure these rights,
governments are instituted among men. In essence, Gerber maintains that the Declaration articulates the
philosophical ends of our nation and that the Constitution embodies the means to effectuate those ends.
Gerber's analysis reveals that the Constitution cannot be properly understood without recourse to history,
political philosophy, and law.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Proctor:

The book To Secure These Rights: The Declaration of Independence and Constitutional Interpretation make
one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book
can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem using your subject. If you can
make examining a book To Secure These Rights: The Declaration of Independence and Constitutional
Interpretation for being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own capable,
increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open and read a
book To Secure These Rights: The Declaration of Independence and Constitutional Interpretation. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about
this book?

Lisa King:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read
one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual To Secure These Rights: The
Declaration of Independence and Constitutional Interpretation is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
capricious experience.

Emmett Willett:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider any time
those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then
you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take To Secure These Rights: The Declaration of Independence and
Constitutional Interpretation as the daily resource information.

Barbara Guevara:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't work here is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer could be To Secure These Rights: The Declaration of Independence and Constitutional
Interpretation why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th



sense will directly show you to pick up this book.
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