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The Internet stock bubble wasn't just about goggle-eyed day traderstrying to get rich on the Nasdaq and
goateed twenty-five-year-olds playing wannabe Bill Gates. It was also about an America that believed it had
discovered the secret of eternal prosperity: it said something about all of us, and what we thought about
ourselves, as the twenty-first century dawned. John Cassidy's Dot.con brings this tumultuous episode to life.
Moving from the Cold War Pentagon to Silicon Valley to Wall Street and into the homes of millions of
Americans, Cassidy tells the story of the great boom and bust in an authoritative and entertaining narrative.
Featuring all the iconic figures of the Internet era -- Marc Andreessen, Jeff Bezos, Steve Case, Alan
Greenspan, and many others -- and with a new Afterword on the aftermath of the bust, Dot.con is a
panoramic and stirring account of human greed and gullibility.
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From reader reviews:

Phillip Chadwick:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As
you may know that book is very important usually. The book Dot.con: How America Lost Its Mind and
Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest Story Ever Sold (rev. ed.) was making you to know about other
knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The book Dot.con:
How America Lost Its Mind and Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest Story Ever Sold (rev. ed.) is not
only giving you much more new information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can
spend your personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship while using book Dot.con: How
America Lost Its Mind and Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest Story Ever Sold (rev. ed.). You never
sense lose out for everything should you read some books.

Robin Gilbertson:

The particular book Dot.con: How America Lost Its Mind and Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest Story
Ever Sold (rev. ed.) has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was
published by the very famous author. The author makes some research previous to write this book. This
particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning this book.

Gail Beattie:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book you
have read is usually Dot.con: How America Lost Its Mind and Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest Story
Ever Sold (rev. ed.).

Elizabeth Acker:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This book Dot.con: How America Lost Its Mind and Money in the Internet Era: The Greatest
Story Ever Sold (rev. ed.) was filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about
your science competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big
benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to
get book that you simply wanted.
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