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Learn how to alter this Altoid tin into a mini scrapbook highlighting 10 Things You Love About Someone.
Techniques used in the project include stamping, punching, and die-cutting.

This step-by-step tutorial contains over 20 color photographs to walk you through the project. Written by
paper-crafter Jen Peel , who teaches rubber stamping and scrapbooking to both kids and adults.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Tran:

The book 10 Things I Love About You Tin can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. So just why must we leave the great thing like a book 10 Things I Love About You Tin? A number of
you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is
absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for
that, you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book 10 Things I Love About You Tin has
simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous
world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Cynthia Carter:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this 10 Things I Love About You Tin book
since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Dennis Rodriguez:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This 10 Things I Love About You Tin can be the
response, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in
this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Virginia Doak:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed to be
exactly added. This book 10 Things I Love About You Tin was filled about science. Spend your time to add
your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they
reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a publication. In
the modern era like now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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