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For decades, the fundamental processes underlying memory and attention have been understood within an
"information processing" framework in which information passes from one processing stage to another,
leading eventually to a response. More recently, however, the attempt to build a general theoretical
framework for information processing has been largely supplanted in favor of two more recent approaches:
parallel/connectionist models of processing and direct investigations of brain function. In Memory and
Attention, cognitive psychologist Nelson Cowan reconciles theoretical conflicts in the literature to presents
an important, analytical update of the traditional information-processing approach by modifying it to
incorporate the last few decades of research on memory, attention, and brain functioning. Throughout, the
author cogently considers and ultimately refutes recent challenges to the fundamental assumption of the
existence of special short-term memory and selective attention faculties. He also draws a new distinction
between memory processes operating inside and outside of the focus of attention. Coherent and balanced, the
book offers a clearer understanding of how memory and attention operate together, and how both functions
are produced by brain processes. It will be welcomed by students and researchers in cognitive psychology.
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From reader reviews:

Carlos Garcia:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what one you should start with. This Attention and Memory: An
Integrated Framework (Oxford Psychology Series) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the
world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Tammy Crider:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Attention and Memory: An Integrated
Framework (Oxford Psychology Series) can be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are
therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Madeline Cecil:

You will get this Attention and Memory: An Integrated Framework (Oxford Psychology Series) by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only through written or printed but also can you enjoy
this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by your local mobile phone
and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about
your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's
try to choose proper ways for you.

Harry Alvey:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know
that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something
by book. Different categories of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually
Attention and Memory: An Integrated Framework (Oxford Psychology Series).
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