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While the destruction of the World Trade Center and the strike against the Pentagon shocked the world at
large, experts on terrorism like Walter Laqueur couldn't feign complete surprise.

In No End to War, Laqueur, who has devoted three decades to the study of political violence, answers the
most-often raised questions about terrorism in the light of 9/11 and the still unsolved Anthrax letters.

First, what constitutes terrorism? What is new about the "new" terrorism? Why is the Muslim world the most
potent breeding ground of this new terrorism? To what extent is religion itself a factor? Is there a clash of
civilizations between the Muslim world and the largely Christian or post-Christian West? Is America at
fault? Israel? Did European nations turn a blind eye to terrorists and their sympathizers in their midst? To
what extent are poverty and oppression the causes of terrorism? What is the likelihood that terrorists will
obtain weapons of mass destruction-chemical, biological, or nuclear? Why was the United States unprepared
for 9/11? Why the intelligence failure? Are Islamic terrorists the only terrorists we need to fear? What about
other terrorists from the right of the left, ecoterrorists or anti-globalization terrorists? And finally, what is the
best defense against terrorism?
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Marsh:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is high. For
you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular No End to War: Terrorism in
the Twenty-First Century book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more
than just a book.

David Cain:

The publication with title No End to War: Terrorism in the Twenty-First Century has lot of information that
you can understand it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new expertise the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the the
positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Robin Castillo:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition details. Even you love No End to War: Terrorism in the Twenty-First Century, you
can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is
it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Kaci Carter:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This No End to War: Terrorism in the
Twenty-First Century can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently out
of date, spending your time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
publications have than the others?
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