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This book examines and systematises the theoretical dimensions of paradiplomacy - the role of subnational
governments in international relations.

Throughout the world, subnational governments play an active role in international relations by participating
in international trade, cultural missions and diplomatic relations with foreign powers. These governments,
including states in the USA and landers in Germany, can sometimes even challenge the official foreign
policy of their national government. These activities, which are regularly promoting the subnational
government’s interests, have been labelled as ‘paradiplomacy’. Through a systematisation of the different
approaches in understanding constituent diplomacy, the author constructs an integrative theoretical
explanatory framework to guide research on regional governments’ involvement in international affairs.

The framework is based on a multiple-response questionnaire technique (MRQ) which provides the matrix of
possible answers on a set of key questions for paradiplomacy scholarship. This comprehensive analysis of
the phenomenon of paradiplomacy sheds light on the development of federalism and multi-level governance
in a new global environment and contributes to the debates on the issue of 'actorness' in contemporary
international affairs.

This book will be of much interest to students of diplomacy, federalism, governance, foreign policy and IR,
as well as practitioners of diplomacy.
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Apperson:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the item for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of Theory and
Practice of Paradiplomacy: Subnational Governments in International Affairs (Routledge New Diplomacy
Studies) book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Timothy Walker:

The e-book untitled Theory and Practice of Paradiplomacy: Subnational Governments in International
Affairs (Routledge New Diplomacy Studies) is the guide that recommended to you to see. You can see the
quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language that creator use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Theory and
Practice of Paradiplomacy: Subnational Governments in International Affairs (Routledge New Diplomacy
Studies) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Mikel Davis:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that
fantastic as in the outside search likes. Maybe you answer could be Theory and Practice of Paradiplomacy:
Subnational Governments in International Affairs (Routledge New Diplomacy Studies) why because the
great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.

Justin Davis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that query
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by book. Amount types
of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims Theory and Practice of
Paradiplomacy: Subnational Governments in International Affairs (Routledge New Diplomacy Studies).
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