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NAMED ONE OF THE BEST BOOKS OF THE YEAR BY KIRKUS REVIEWS

For readers of Jonathan Franzen and Richard Russo, Jonathan Dee’s novels are masterful works of literary
fiction. In this sharply observed tale of self-invention and public scandal, Dee raises a trenchant question:
what do we really want when we ask for forgiveness?
 
Once a privileged and loving couple, the Armsteads have now reached a breaking point. Ben, a partner in a
prestigious law firm, has become unpredictable at work and withdrawn at home—a change that weighs
heavily on his wife, Helen, and their preteen daughter, Sara. Then, in one afternoon, Ben’s recklessness takes
an alarming turn, and everything the Armsteads have built together unravels, swiftly and spectacularly.
 
Thrust back into the working world, Helen finds a job in public relations and relocates with Sara from their
home in upstate New York to an apartment in Manhattan. There, Helen discovers she has a rare gift,
indispensable in the world of image control: She can convince arrogant men to admit their mistakes, spinning
crises into second chances. Yet redemption is more easily granted in her professional life than in her personal
one.
 
As she is confronted with the biggest case of her career, the fallout from her marriage, and Sara’s
increasingly distant behavior, Helen must face the limits of accountability and her own capacity for
forgiveness.

Look for special features inside. Join the Random House Reader’s Circle for author chats and more.

Praise for A Thousand Pardons
 
“A Thousand Pardons is that rare thing: a genuine literary thriller. Eerily suspenseful and packed with
dramatic event, it also offers a trenchant, hilarious portrait of our collective longing for authenticity in these
overmediated times.”—Jennifer Egan, Pulitzer Prize–winning author of A Visit from the Goon Squad

“Hugely enjoyable . . . Dee is a snappy, cinematic writer. . . . A Thousand Pardons moves fast. It’s a mere
200 or so pages, and it packs a lot of turns of fate within there.”—The Boston Globe
 
“Dee’s gifts are often dazzling and his material meticulously shaped. . . . [He] articulates complex emotional
dynamics with precision and insight.”—The New York Times Book Review
 
“Some stories begin with a bang. And some begin with a roaring fireball of truth. Jonathan Dee’s latest novel
belongs in the latter camp.”—O: The Oprah Magazine
 
“Dee bounds gracefully among Helen’s, Ben’s, and Sara’s points of view as they try to reassemble their
lives. Their stories feel honest, and the prose is beautiful.”—Entertainment Weekly
 
“A page turner . . . What a triumph.”—Kirkus Reviews (starred review)
 



“Graceful prose and such a sharp understanding of human weakness that you’ll wince as you
laugh.”—People
 
“Propulsively readable.”—The Millions
 
“Dee continues to establish himself as an ironic observer of contemporary behavior. . . . The plot is energetic.
. . . But most compelling is the acuteness of the details.”—The Atlantic
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From reader reviews:

Jose Goodell:

The reserve with title A Thousand Pardons: A Novel includes a lot of information that you can understand it.
You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to understand
how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you inside new era of the the positive
effect. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Linda Pinkerton:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the entire
day to reading a book. The book A Thousand Pardons: A Novel it is rather good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough
space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from
a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high quality.

Joann Huertas:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled A
Thousand Pardons: A Novel the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single
aspect that maybe not known for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word
written in a publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get
previous to. The A Thousand Pardons: A Novel giving you another experience more than blown away the
mind but also giving you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning an
activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Cameron Rodriquez:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of book A
Thousand Pardons: A Novel. You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may
add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It
can bring you from one location to other place.
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