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"Chase Joynt and Mike Hoolboom here give each other the gift so many people only dream of: ample,
unhurried space to unspool crucial stories of one’s life, and an attentive, impassioned, invested, intelligent
receiver on the other side. The gift to the reader is both the example of their exchange, and the nuanced,
idiosyncratic, finely rendered examination it offers of biopolitical experiences which, in many ways, define
our times. I’m so glad they have each other, and that we have this."
– Maggie Nelson

"You Only Live Twice is an intelligent ode to enchantment, to the possibilities that arise in their 'second lives'
when all past expectations have been foreclosed."
– Chris Kraus

"The writing is out of the park — strong and surprising, a relay race of brilliant twirling, tossing thoughts
back and forth like balletic rugby bros. Joynt and Hoolboom’s dances of disclosure are so courageous and
generative, gifts to us all."
– John Greyson

What if it's not true that you only live once? In this genre-transcending work of true fiction, trans writer and
media artist Chase Joynt and HIV-positive movie artist Mike Hoolboom come together over the films of
Chris Marker to exchange transition tales: confessional missives that map out the particularities of what they
call "second lives": Chase's transition from female to male and Mike's near-death from AIDS in the 1990s.
Chronicling reactions from friends and families, medical mechanics, and different versions of "coming out,'
YOLT explores art, love, sex, death, and life in changed bodies.

The unspoken promise was that in our second life we would become the question to every answer, jumping
across borders until they finally dissolved. Man and woman. Queer and straight.

Mike Hoolboom is an author and filmmaker based in Toronto. He has written four books, received more
than thirty international film prizes, and enjoyed nine international retrospectives of his work.

Chase Joynt is a Toronto-based moving-image artist and writer who has exhibited his work internationally.
He recently received a Mellon Fellowship in Arts Practice and Scholarship at the University of Chicago.
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From reader reviews:

Alex Lynch:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide You Only Live Twice: Sex, Death, and
Transition (Exploded Views) will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence
if you can know about anything. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make
you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or
acceptable book with you?

William Wright:

The particular book You Only Live Twice: Sex, Death, and Transition (Exploded Views) has a lot details on
it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
This articles author makes some research ahead of write this book. This specific book very easy to read you
can find the point easily after scanning this book.

Linda Harris:

Why? Because this You Only Live Twice: Sex, Death, and Transition (Exploded Views) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret
that inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such incredible way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning fully. So , it
is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This unique book
will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and
your critical thinking means. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the
publication store hurriedly.

James Floyd:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to
understand that reading is very important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add
you knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning
something by book. Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims
You Only Live Twice: Sex, Death, and Transition (Exploded Views).
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