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Offshore Risk Assessment was the first book to deal with quantified risk assessment (QRA) as applied
specifically to offshore installations and operations. Risk assessment techniques have been used for more
than three decades in the offshore oil and gas industry, and their use is set to expand increasingly as the
industry moves into new areas and faces new challenges in older regions.

 

This updated and expanded third edition has been informed by a major R&D program on offshore risk
assessment in Norway and summarizes research from 2006 to the present day. Rooted with a thorough
discussion of risk metrics and risk analysis methodology,  subsequent chapters are devoted to analytical
approaches to escalation, escape, evacuation and rescue analysis of safety and emergency systems.

 

Separate chapters analyze the main hazards of offshore structures: fire, explosion, collision, and falling
objects as well as structural and marine hazards. Risk mitigation and control are discussed, as well as an
illustration of how the results from quantitative risk assessment studies should be presented. The third second
edition has a stronger focus on the use of risk assessment techniques in the operation of offshore
installations. Also decommissioning of installations is covered.

 

Not only does Offshore Risk Assessment describe the state of the art of QRA, it also identifies weaknesses
and areas that need further development. This new edition also illustrates applications or quantitative risk
analysis methodology to offshore petroleum applications.

 

A comprehensive reference for academics and students of marine/offshore risk assessment and management,
the book should also be owned by professionals in the industry, contractors, suppliers, consultants and
regulatory authorities.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Ray:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
really need something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
individual? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored
faster. And you have time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to
answer that question because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on guardería until university need this kind of Offshore Risk
Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of QRA Studies (Springer Series in Reliability
Engineering) to read.

Kim Salgado:

This Offshore Risk Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of QRA Studies (Springer
Series in Reliability Engineering) book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually information inside this book incredible fresh,
you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This specific
Offshore Risk Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of QRA Studies (Springer Series in
Reliability Engineering) without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in pondering
and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Offshore Risk Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and
Applications of QRA Studies (Springer Series in Reliability Engineering) can bring whenever you are and
not make your handbag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it with your lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This Offshore Risk Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of
QRA Studies (Springer Series in Reliability Engineering) having good arrangement in word along with
layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Jack Rolfes:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about the data about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are many
kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their expertise in writing, they
also doing some investigation before they write with their book. One of them is this Offshore Risk
Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of QRA Studies (Springer Series in Reliability
Engineering).



Marianne Stromain:

The reserve with title Offshore Risk Assessment vol 2.: Principles, Modelling and Applications of QRA
Studies (Springer Series in Reliability Engineering) includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You
can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how
the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside new era of the the positive effect.
You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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