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* * *

This fifth book of digital mandalas brings together squares. While a perfect square does not naturally exist in
nature, the square and the right angle serve several specific and necessary functions in mathematics and in
life. They facilitate the four quadrants in mathematics, the four seasons of the year, the four corners in a
room, the four directions of the compass (N,E,S,W), and even the four basic elements of air, earth, fire and
water.

The mandala is a spiritual and ritualistic symbol in both Hinduism and Buddhism. In general, it is a
microcosmic representation of the Universe.

The mandala is used to help focus attention on spiritual guidance, and for mindful practices such as
meditation. Most mandalas, especially today, are circular in design. The circle has long been a spiritual
symbol of wholeness.

But the use of mandalas isn't just spiritual. Therapists as far back as Carl Jung have often used mandalas with
their patients.

For the past 30 years I have used mandalas in my watercolor and silk paintings, as well as my glass jewelry
fabrication, my cloth fabric dying, and the quilts I design and construct.

Psychologists claim that coloring is the next best thing to meditation. I find mandalas are nearly as
therapeutic to create as they are to color.

Pick up a coloring book today and don't forget to color outside the box.

Volumes in the Mandala Series:
- Heart~2~Hear
- Star Gazing
- Florabunda
- Round & Round
- Square Roots

and a specially priced Magical Design Sampler Volume with samples from each full book. Also available in
mini take-along sized books.
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From reader reviews:

Rita Dubois:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are reading whatever they get
because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't like reading through a book?
Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you
will require this Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to
Color & Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5).

Brian Nelson:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along
Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to Color & Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5).
You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important some
sort of book Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to Color
& Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5). You can add understanding and of course you
can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple point until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or searching by internet system.
It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Bernadine Williams:

Here thing why this specific Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas
for You to Color & Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5) are different and dependable
to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it depends in the content of computer which is the
content is as tasty as food or not. Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48
Mandalas for You to Color & Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5) giving you
information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that
similar with Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to Color
& Enjoy (Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open
up your own personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is possibly can be
happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by
train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Square Roots -
Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to Color & Enjoy (Magical Design
Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5) in e-book can be your option.



Silvia Doucet:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you read a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that
you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to soon.
The Square Roots - Mini (Pocket Sized Take-Along Coloring Book): 48 Mandalas for You to Color & Enjoy
(Magical Design Mini Coloring Books) (Volume 5) provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.
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