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A must-have design source, with cutting-edge ideas from the world’s best designers and architects.
Contemporary Interiors showcases a wide range of twenty-first-century residences by world-renowned
architects and designers. Filled with more than 300 color illustrations, specialist Philip Jodidio compiles
from around the globe fifty of the most innovative homes designed and built within the last five years.
Whether urban or rural, large or small, the book has projects that are international in scope: a summer home
in Montauk by Roman & Williams, Houssein Jarouche’s apartment in Brazil by Triptyque; a David Adjaye
house in West London; a Luxembourg "eco-green" house by Richard Meier; a Studio Mumbai Palmyra
house in India; a Shigeru Ban–designed villa in Sri Lanka; a Tadao Ando house in Monterrey; Sean
Godsell’s Edward Street House in Melbourne, Australia. The book has hundreds of design ideas from
minimialist white to cozy color that can be applied to each room of the house. Sou Fujimoto experiments
with a house that is entirely open, without clearly defined floors; Werner Sobek’s B10 House is designed to
be dismantled in one day and rebuilt in the same time frame; Eduardo Arroyo’s house in Spain has iridescent
polycarbonate walls that change colors with the light; the Leaf House by Mareines + Patalano architects has
a curving swimming pool that enters the house and passes below the dining room where it becomes a pond
with aquatic plants and fish; Steven Holl’s gallery and house in Seoul has his signature door that wraps into a
corner, notched walls, and neo-constructivist lighting fixtures.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Feist:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book allowed Contemporary
Interiors: A Source of Design Ideas? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you
can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it has the
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Belen Riedel:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the resources
inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to be smart in
obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Looking at a book can help
individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Contemporary Interiors: A Source of Design
Ideas book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred
percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Rita Furguson:

The book untitled Contemporary Interiors: A Source of Design Ideas is the reserve that recommended to you
to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to an individual. The language that
article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was
did a lot of research when write the book, therefore the information that they share to your account is
absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Contemporary Interiors: A Source of Design Ideas
from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

David Thompson:

The reason? Because this Contemporary Interiors: A Source of Design Ideas is an unordinary book that the
inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such awesome way makes the
content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book
will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your expertise and your
critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the
guide store hurriedly.
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