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Separately they were formidable?together they were unstoppable. Despite their intriguing lives and the deep
impact they had on their community and region, the story of Richard Joshua Reynolds (1850–1918) and
Katharine Smith Reynolds (1880–1924) has never been fully told. Now Michele Gillespie provides a
sweeping account of how R. J. and Katharine succeeded in realizing their American dreams.

From relatively modest beginnings, R. J. launched the R. J. Reynolds Tobacco Company, which would
eventually develop two hugely profitable products, Prince Albert pipe tobacco and Camel cigarettes. His
marriage in 1905 to Katharine Smith, a dynamic woman thirty years his junior, marked the beginning of a
unique partnership that went well beyond the family. As a couple, the Reynoldses conducted a far-ranging
social life and, under Katharine’s direction, built Reynolda House, a breathtaking estate and model farm.
Providing leadership to a series of progressive reform movements and business innovations, they helped
drive one of the South’s best examples of rapid urbanization and changing race relations in the city of
Winston-Salem, North Carolina. Together they became one of the New South’s most influential elite
couples. Upon R. J.’s death, Katharine reinvented herself, marrying a World War I veteran many years her
junior and engaging in a significant new set of philanthropic pursuits.

Katharine and R. J. Reynolds reveals the broad economic, social, cultural, and political changes that were the
backdrop to the Reynoldses’ lives. Portraying a New South shaped by tensions between rural poverty and
industrial transformation, white working-class inferiority and deeply entrenched racism, and the
solidification of a one-party political system, Gillespie offers a masterful life-and-times biography of these
important North Carolinians.
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From reader reviews:

Alberto Redden:

The book Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South make you feel
enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get your
best friend when you getting stress or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make
examining a book Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South for
being your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge
about a few or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a publication Katharine and
R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Amy Nichols:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making
of the New South book is readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want
to provide to you. The writer connected with Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the
Making of the New South content conveys thinking easily to understand by many individuals. The printed
and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different available as it. So , do you continue to
thinking Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South is not loveable to
be your top listing reading book?

Teresa Cook:

The ability that you get from Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New
South may be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get
considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but Katharine and R. J. Reynolds:
Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article
writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood through anyone who read this because
the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well.
Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We advise you for having this particular Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of
the New South instantly.

Helen Noyola:

The book untitled Katharine and R. J. Reynolds: Partners of Fortune in the Making of the New South contain
a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very
clear to see all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was written



by famous author. The author will bring you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site and also order it. Have a
nice study.
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