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Murkin was the code name chosen by the FBI for their investigation into the assassination of Dr. Martin
Luther King, Jr., in 1968. Today, 20 years after the fatal shooting of the civil rights leader, Philip H.
Melanson, a renowned authority on American political assassinations, unveils his own investigation into the
murder. Melanson . . . has done an exhaustively thorough job on the still-mysterious King assassination.
After following Melanson's meticulous pursuit of seemingly every lead in the case--including interviews
with the men whose names were used as aliases for alleged killer James Earl Ray--there can be little doubt in
the reader's mind that neither of the two official versions of what happened could have been the whole truth.
The first was the ever-popular notion of the lone killer: Ray. The second, propounded by a clearly inept
congressional investigation a decade after the 1969 shooting, was that an ill-defined racist conspiracy was
behind the assassination. What seems unarguable is that Ray, a petty criminal, could not have killed King
unaided. There are too many improbabilities--the source of his carefully chosen Canadian aliases, the
identity of the `fat man' who brought him a `letter' in Toronto during his escape, the odd setup at the rooming
house from which the shot was fired. It is Melanson's thesis that there was high-level intelligence
involvement, probably by the CIA, which was violently alarmed by King's anti-Vietnam stance. Publisher's
Weekly

Murkin was the code name chosen by the FBI for the investigation into the assassination of Dr. Martin
Luther King, Jr., in 1968. Today, twenty years after the fatal shooting of the civil rights leader, Philip H.
Melanson, a renowned authority on American political assassinations, unveils his own investigation into the
murder. Through extensive interviews, research, and Freedom of Information Act requests, Melanson
analyzes the official investigations, the evidence, the performance of law enforcement officials, the role of
James Earl Ray, and the questions of conspiracy. Much of the data presented has never before been
published. Based on his detailed investigation, Melanson offers a revisionist interpretation of the King case,
demonstrating that it remains unsolved.

Melanson argues persuasively that both the FBI's conclusion that Ray acted alone and the later 1978 House
Select Committee on Assassinations decision that Ray was backed by a conspiracy of St. Louis-based white
supremacists are not supported by the evidence. Although Melanson concludes that Ray did not, in fact, act
alone, he contends that the official investigations were so flawed that the conspirators behind him are still
unidentified. His own conclusions regarding the probable source of the conspiracy offer a sobering
indictment of the ways in which powerful interests, left unchecked, can wreak havoc on American
democratic processes.
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From reader reviews:

Eileen Williams:

Typically the book The Murkin Conspiracy: An Investigation into the Assassination of Dr. Martin Luther
King, Jr. will bring someone to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to
elucidate the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to see, this book very suitable to you.
The book The Murkin Conspiracy: An Investigation into the Assassination of Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr. is
much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can
more readily to read the book.

Burton Zinn:

The book untitled The Murkin Conspiracy: An Investigation into the Assassination of Dr. Martin Luther
King, Jr. contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The
language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the
item. The book was published by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of literary works.
It is possible to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or program, so you can
read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Chester Hassel:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make you
to definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to you personally is The Murkin Conspiracy: An Investigation into the Assassination of
Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr. this guide consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now.
This kind of book was represented how do the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer make
usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Donna Feuerstein:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Murkin Conspiracy: An Investigation into
the Assassination of Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr. can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know.
You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So
what these books have than the others?
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