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'With God's help, I, Bede ... have assembled these facts about the history of the Church in Britain ...
from the traditions of our forebears, and from my own personal knowledge'

Written in AD 731, Bede's Ecclesiastical History of the English People is the first account of Anglo-Saxon
England ever written, and remains our single most valuable source for this period. It begins with Julius
Caesar's invasion in the first century BC and goes on to tell of the kings and bishops, monks and nuns who
helped to develop government and convert the people to Christianity during these crucial formative years.
Relating the deeds of great men and women but also describing landscape, customs and ordinary lives, this is
a rich, vivid portrait of an emerging church and nation by the 'Father of English History'.

Leo Sherley-Price's translation from the Latin brings us an accurate and readable version of Bede's History.
This edition includes Bede's Letter to Egbert, denouncing false monasteries; and The Death of Bede, an
admirable eye-witness account by Cuthbert, monk and later Abbot of Jarrow, both translated by D. H.
Farmer.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Nora Carter:

The book Ecclesiastical History of the English People (Penguin Classics) give you a sense of feeling enjoy
for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best
friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book
Ecclesiastical History of the English People (Penguin Classics) to be your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like wide open and read a book Ecclesiastical History of the English People (Penguin
Classics). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other individuals.
So , how do you think about this reserve?

Patricia Gagliano:

This book untitled Ecclesiastical History of the English People (Penguin Classics) to be one of several books
this best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon it.
You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it through online. The publisher
of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your
Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Pamela Eckert:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read
any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a guide. The book Ecclesiastical History of the English People (Penguin Classics) it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book.
In case you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Ronda Powers:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Ecclesiastical History of the
English People (Penguin Classics) that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by means of reading
this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world much
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading routine only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want
to start reading through as your good habit, it is possible to pick Ecclesiastical History of the English People
(Penguin Classics) become your personal starter.
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