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The Effortless Whole-Foods Cure That Whittles Your Waistline and Fights Disease

It's rare when a diet comes along that really makes an impact. The Gold CoastCure is that kind of diet
program. It's not just an eating plan that helps you look and feel great in your favorite jeans--it's a way of
living that vastly improves your health and prevents disease. That's what it did for coauthor Ivy Larson,
whose multiple sclerosis left her unable to walk up a flight of stairs until she and her husband, Andrew
Larson, M.D., devised the Gold Coast Cure--an anti-inflammatory nutritional plan consisting of whole
foods--which put her MS in remission for the past eight years.

Since then, The Gold Coast Cure has helped thousands of people lose weight, tone up, and prevent or reverse
health conditions related to poor nutrition, obesity and inflammation, including:

heart disease●

high blood pressure●

high cholesterol●

type II diabetes●

osteoporosis●

osteoarthritis●

asthma●

allergies●

fibromyalgia●

multiple sclerosis●

vascular dementia●

You will see results immediately and reach your goal in just five weeks. The secret to the success of the Gold
Coast Cure is its realistic approach to nutrition--no obsessing over calories or carb-counting, and you can
indulge in one sweet treat and one alcoholic beverage a day--every day! With over seventy-five delicious
whole foods recipes, two weeks of meal plans, and a time-saving fitness routine that you can do in just thirty
minutes, three times a week, it's easier than ever to make the Cure work for you.

"..For those who've struggled with any of the diets being touted by today's high-profile experts, the hope the
Larsons offer will likely come as refreshing news."
-Publishers Weekly
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From reader reviews:

Wayne Millican:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare
time to take a wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled
The Gold Coast Cure: The 5-Week Health and Body Makeover A Lifestyle Plan to Shed Pounds, Gain
Health and Reverse 10 Diseases? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already know beside you
can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or
you have other opinion?

Patricia Whitmore:

This book untitled The Gold Coast Cure: The 5-Week Health and Body Makeover A Lifestyle Plan to Shed
Pounds, Gain Health and Reverse 10 Diseases to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this specific book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is
no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Elaine Davenport:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled The
Gold Coast Cure: The 5-Week Health and Body Makeover A Lifestyle Plan to Shed Pounds, Gain Health
and Reverse 10 Diseases your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that
maybe not known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a
publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get ahead of.
The The Gold Coast Cure: The 5-Week Health and Body Makeover A Lifestyle Plan to Shed Pounds, Gain
Health and Reverse 10 Diseases giving you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but
also giving you useful info for your better life in this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is
your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game.
Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Debra Heffner:

The book untitled The Gold Coast Cure: The 5-Week Health and Body Makeover A Lifestyle Plan to Shed
Pounds, Gain Health and Reverse 10 Diseases contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains
your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The author brings
you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can



open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice go through.
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