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A hilarious collection of the stubbornly ignorant and shockingly ludicrous remarks made by former Alaskan
governor and 2008 Vice Presidential candidate Sarah Palin compiled by New York Times best-selling author
Leland Gregory. Includes B&W photographs.

Alaskan governor Sarah Palin launched onto the national political scene in 2008 when she was unexpectedly
chosen as John McCain's running mate. Soon after, her oratory foibles, shaky stance on political policy, and
ignorance of national/world affairs became priceless fodder for journalists and comedians. Now New York
Times best-selling human stupidity historian Leland Gregory sets his sights on everyone's favorite rogue
hockey-mom in You Betcha! The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin.

Whether she's bagging on the President at a Tea Party, waging war on Family Guy, or slandering Bristol's
ex-beau, one thing's for certain--Sarah Palin loves to be heard. Gregory has hunted down Palin's most cringe-
worthy comments, including excerpts from the infamous Katie Couric interview, her acceptance speech at
the Republican National Convention, and sketchy explanations for her resignation as governor. Death panels,
helicopter moose hunting, and all of her magic maverick moments are included in this anthology of photos,
quotes, and anecdotal material that is sure to keep readers laughing so hard they'll want to cry.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Sanders:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin book is
readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
studying experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer of
You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin content conveys the idea easily to understand by most
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you
nevertheless thinking You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin is not loveable to be your top record
reading book?

Lori Roth:

The knowledge that you get from You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin could be the more deep
you looking the information that hide in the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean
that this book is hard to understand but You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin giving you
enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by
anyone who read this because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes
your vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed
or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this You Betcha!: The Witless Wisdom
of Sarah Palin instantly.

Eddie Barber:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere?
It ok you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like You Betcha!:
The Witless Wisdom of Sarah Palin which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
observe.

Jessica Henriquez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading
is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. Numerous
books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims You Betcha!: The Witless
Wisdom of Sarah Palin.
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