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From sash windows and ceramic tiles to barracks and warehouses, industrialized building has thrived since
the nineteenth century in Europe and America. Yet architects have neglected this area of practical
construction in favor of historical, theoretical, and artistic analyses, resulting in the emergence of an
influential building industry with architects on the far margins. Colin Davies explores in The Prefabricated
Home how the relationship between architecture and industrialized building has now become an urgent issue
for architects.

The Prefabricated Home outlines the methods and motives of prefabricated buildings and assesses their
architectural implications. Davies traces the origins of the branded building phenomenon with examples
ranging from the Dymaxion bathroom to IKEA's "Bo Klok" house. He also analyzes the use of industrialized
buildings worldwide—including McDonald's drive-through restaurants and contrasts the aesthetic concerns
of architects against the economic ones of industrialized building manufacturers. Ultimately, The
Prefabricated Home proposes a partnership of architects and industrialized building that could potentially
produce an exciting new type of humane and eco-conscious architecture.
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From reader reviews:

Bryant Kelly:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well,
probably you will need this The Prefabricated Home.

Dustin Davis:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book The Prefabricated Home will make you to
end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they
may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Timothy Duchene:

The book with title The Prefabricated Home includes a lot of information that you can find out it. You can
get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this
e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside new era of the globalization. You can
read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Sandra Brown:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of book The
Prefabricated Home. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could
possibly add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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