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Beneath the surface of the apparently untutored and deceptively frank Abraham Lincoln ran private tunnels
of self-taught study, a restless philosophical curiosity, and a profound grasp of the fundamentals of
democracy. Now, in Lincoln: A Very Short Introduction, the award-winning Lincoln authority Allen C.
Guelzo offers a penetrating look into the mind of one of our greatest presidents.

If Lincoln was famous for reading aloud from joke books, Guelzo shows that he also plunged deeply into the
mainstream of nineteenth-century liberal democratic thought. Guelzo takes us on a wide-ranging exploration
of problems that confronted Lincoln and liberal democracy--equality, opportunity, the rule of law, slavery,
freedom, peace, and his legacy. The book sets these problems and Lincoln's responses against the larger
world of American and trans-Atlantic liberal democracy in the 19th century, comparing Lincoln not just to
Andrew Jackson or John Calhoun, but to British thinkers such as Richard Cobden, Jeremy Bentham, and
John Bright, and to French observers Alexis de Tocqueville and François Guizot. The Lincoln we meet here
is an Enlightenment figure who struggled to create a common ground between a people focused on
individual rights and a society eager to establish a certain moral, philosophical, and intellectual bedrock.
Lincoln insisted that liberal democracy had a higher purpose, which was the realization of a morally right
political order. But how to interject that sense of moral order into a system that values personal self-
satisfaction--"the pursuit of happiness"--remains a fundamental dilemma even today.

Abraham Lincoln was a man who, according to his friend and biographer William Henry Herndon, "lived in
the mind." Guelzo paints a marvelous portrait of this Lincoln--Lincoln the man of ideas--providing new
insights into one of the giants of American history.

About the Series: Combining authority with wit, accessibility, and style, Very Short Introductions offer an
introduction to some of life's most interesting topics. Written by experts for the newcomer, they demonstrate
the finest contemporary thinking about the central problems and issues in hundreds of key topics, from
philosophy to Freud, quantum theory to Islam.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Rayes:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Lincoln: A
Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) suitable to you? The actual book was written by well
known writer in this era. The book untitled Lincoln: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions)is
the main one of several books this everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the
world. When you read this book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before. The
author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this
guide. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of
the world in this particular book.

Robert Music:

Lincoln: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article
author giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Lincoln: A Very Short
Introduction (Very Short Introductions) nevertheless doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This great information
could drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Jonathan Solis:

This Lincoln: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) is great publication for you because the
content which is full of information for you who also always deal with world and get to make decision every
minute. This book reveal it facts accurately using great organize word or we can claim no rambling sentences
in it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you
straight forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Lincoln:
A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in
it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small
right but this guide already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. hectic do
you still doubt this?

Andrew Murphy:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This e-book Lincoln: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) was filled
about science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you



can feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book you wanted.
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