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The hey-day of the British gypsy caravan was short, only about 70 years, during which period it grew from a
simple utility vehicle, blossomed and flourished as a mobile work of art, then disappeared from common
sight. These caravans were masterpieces of woodcraft and design, and the best of them cost as much as a
small house. Unlike any small house, almost half the cost was in the decoration. This beautifully illustrated
book presents the different types of caravan and the great variety of art which was carved and painted upon
them and their brothers-in-transport, the old narrowboats. While there were certain rules and conventions of
style, the decoration on and in all the types was ultimately governed only by how much money could be
spent. The caravan in particular was the supreme status symbol among travelling people and its art the prime
means for expressing where one stood in the world. This book seeks to display and explain this specialised
art form for future generations. Photographer John Baxter was the winner of 'Best Image' in the SUN
Awards, for commercial photographers in the North of England, in 2007. Gordon Thorburn has enjoyed a
career in journalism, copywriting and freelance publishing. He has won an award for scriptwriting as well as
the Lakeland Book of the Year and Jennings prize for his book "The Appleby Rai".
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From reader reviews:

Bryan Donovan:

The book Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal Barges will bring you to definitely the new experience
of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to
see, this book very ideal to you. The book Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal Barges is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to
read the book.

Richard Horgan:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can
certainly share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their
reader with their story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they
write about the data about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always
try to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the book. One
of them is this Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal Barges.

Janice Wilson:

Why? Because this Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal Barges is an unordinary book that the inside
of the guide waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this
book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such remarkable way makes the content on
the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot
of positive aspects than the other book have got such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Robert Mangino:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose typically the book Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal
Barges to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when
you just like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion
about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through
it. Beside that the e-book Travelling Art: Gypsy Caravans and Canal Barges can to be your friend when
you're really feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of their time.
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