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#1 NEW YORK TIMES BEST SELLER
OSCAR FOR BEST FILM

Twelve Years a Slave is the true story of Solomon Northup, born a freeman in New York, but kidnaped in
Washington D.C. and sold into slavery. Northup was kept in bondage for 12 years, until being able to write
to friends and family who secured his release.

Twelve Years a Slave is currently #1 on the New York Times Best Seller List and was the inspiration for the
Oscar winning film 12 Years a Slave,

Solomon Northup's memoir Twelve Years a Slave provides extensive details about the slave markets in
Washington D.C. and New Orleans, the horrors of life on the plantations, and the cruel treatment of the
slaves, as well as describing the cotton and sugar cultivation on main plantations in Louisiana.

Solomon Northup’s slave narrative Twelve Years a Slave was rediscovered in the 1960's, after being
forgotten for about 100 years.

Written by a man who had lived as a free man for more than thirty years before being forced into slavery,
Twelve Years a Slave memoir was put on paper one year after Solomon Northup’s release, soon after Harriet
Beecher Stowe’s Uncle Tom’s Cabin. Solomon Northup’s true story was taken by abolitionist groups as an
instrument to support the fight against slavery.

In 2013, Twelve Years a Slave was adapted into a motion picture entitled 12 Years a Slave, directed by Steve
McQueen and produced by Brad Pitt, who also played a supporting role in the movie. 12 Years a Slave won
the Academy Award for Best Motion Picture.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Williams:

This 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery
and kept in bondage for 12 years book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book will be information inside this reserve incredible fresh,
you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This specific 12
Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and kept
in bondage for 12 years without we know teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't always be worry 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a
free man, sold into slavery and kept in bondage for 12 years can bring once you are and not make your bag
space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and
kept in bondage for 12 years having good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not sense
uninterested in reading.

Megan Martelli:

The book untitled 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold
into slavery and kept in bondage for 12 years is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see the
quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The language that creator use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, so the
information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of 12
Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and kept
in bondage for 12 years from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Gwen Anderson:

This 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery
and kept in bondage for 12 years is great book for you because the content which is full of information for
you who else always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it data
accurately using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the
item hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but
hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having 12 Years a Slave (With the Original
Artwork): Solomon Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and kept in bondage for 12 years in your
hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that
offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , it is good reading book.
Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?



Garth McDonald:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. That 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon
Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and kept in bondage for 12 years can give you a lot of close
friends because by you investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make a person more
like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve
offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than some other make you to
be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have 12 Years a Slave (With the Original Artwork): Solomon
Northup - Born a free man, sold into slavery and kept in bondage for 12 years.
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