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One Day At a Time 12-Step Recovery Slogan Meditation Cards for people recovering from addiction
Twelve-Step recovery is practiced throughout many different fellowships - AA, NA, OA, GA, SA (the list is
endless!) and from these fellowships, "Slogans" (inspirational sayings) were derived to help. countless
individuals struggling with Addiction, obsessive and compulsive behavior with a goal of RECOVERY!
Whether you have 12 hours, 12 days, or 12 years away from your area of struggle, ODAT's Slogan Cards has
something for everybody. Slogans are timeless, because their truth can be applied to just about any situation
that life serves up. Includes 64 professionally printed cards. ODATCards make a wonderful recovery gift,
Great for sponsors and sponsee's alike, support groups or recovery parties.
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From reader reviews:

Essie Ryan:

The book ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book ODATCards
12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards? Several of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in
which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Daniel Hanson:

This ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world
is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This
particular ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards without we realize teach the one who examining it
become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't end up being worry ODATCards 12-Step Recovery
Slogan Cards can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This ODATCards 12-Step Recovery
Slogan Cards having excellent arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not really feel
uninterested in reading.

Susan Bondurant:

The knowledge that you get from ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards could be the more deep you
excavating the information that hide in the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean
that this book is hard to know but ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards giving you enjoyment
feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through
anyone who read this because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book also makes your
own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having that ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan
Cards instantly.

Ann Craft:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you
try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you



have read will be ODATCards 12-Step Recovery Slogan Cards.
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