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The Linguistics of Laughter examines what speakers try to achieve by producing ‘laughter-talk’ (the talk
preceding and eliciting an episode of laughter) and, by using abundant examples from language corpora,
what hearers are signalling when they produce laughter.

In particular, Alan Partington focuses on the tactical use of laughter-talk to achieve specific rhetorical, and
strategic, ends: for example, to construct an identity, to make an argumentative point, to threaten someone
else’s face or save one's own. Although laughter and humour are by no means always related, the book also
considers the implications these corpus-based observations may have about humour theory in general.

As one of the first works to have recourse to such a sizeable databank of examples of laughter in spontaneous
running talk, this impressive volume is an essential point of reference and an inspiration for scholars with an
interest in corpus linguistics, discourse, humour, wordplay, irony and laughter-talk as a social phenomenon.
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From reader reviews:

Noel Stevens:

The book The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the good
thing like a book The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk? A few of you
have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely
right. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for
each other; you could share all of these. Book The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of
Laughter-Talk has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem
the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Adrian Rogers:

This The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk are reliable for you who want
to be considered a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Linguistics of Laughter: A
Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk can be among the great books you must have will be giving you
more than just simple reading food but feed you with information that maybe will shock your prior
knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-
book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-
Talk giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical
thinking that we know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Phyllis Smith:

The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk can be one of your beginner books
that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary which
could increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing
The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of Laughter-Talk but doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of
it. This great information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Michael Marx:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This particular The Linguistics of Laughter: A Corpus-Assisted Study of
Laughter-Talk can give you a lot of buddies because by you taking a look at this one book you have thing
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing
more than different make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Linguistics of
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